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Introduction

The self accreditation program is being offered to eligible cheque printers, and may be
terminated at any time by participating financial institutions without notice or liability (except
for reimbursement of fees paid to the Canadian Payments Association (operating as Payments
Canada), as set out in Appendix A).

The Canadian Payments Association (operating as Payments Canada), together with the support
of its direct clearer/group clearer members and Canadian cheque printers introduced the Cheque
Printer Self Accreditation Program on June 1, 2010 to facilitate the acceptance of cheques
produced by self accredited cheque printers (“Printers”) and processed by financial institutions
with minimal reject rates.

Payments Canada strongly recommends that organizations that print their own cheques or
contract custom cheque orders through a printing company submit samples to a financial
institution for testing to ensure that they meet the specifications outlined in Payments Canada
Standard 006 (“Standard 006”) . In agreeing to meet the prerequisites outlined below and by1

attesting to compliance with Standard 006, a printing company’s cheques that are imprinted with
a valid printer identification number will be exempt from any requirement for routine Standard2

006 testing by a financial institution or its designate.

Eligibility for self accreditation

This self accreditation program is available to all cheque printing companies that: (1) produce
business or retail cheques for sale in Canada; and (2) are able to attest to meeting the
requirements set out in this document.

Roles and responsibilities

Financial institutions: financial institutions agree to exempt any cheques drawn on accounts held
with them that have been produced by a Printer from routine Standard 006 testing. They will also
agree to abide by the dispute resolution process, as set out in section 3.0, below. Financial
institutions reserve the right to conduct non-routine testing on any cheques produced by a Printer

2 When base paper stock is produced in accordance with section 1.4 below, the exemption is only
applicable to the cheque stock and not the MICR line.

1 Standard 006 - Specifications for MICR-Encoded Payment Items available at
https://www.payments.ca/sites/default/files/standard_006_complete.pdf
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(e.g., for reasons of suspect quality or in relation to a specific marketing product such as positive
pay or payee name matching).

Cheque printers: Cheque printers which elect to self-certify under the terms of this program
agree to pay an enrolment fee (and renewal fee) to Payments Canada, comply with the terms of
this program and abide by the dispute resolution process as set out in section 3.0, below.

Payments Canada: Payments Canada will administer the Cheque Printer Self Accreditation
Program.

Under no circumstances will Payments Canada be liable for any loss or damage suffered by a
member or a Printer or any other person for any error or omission pertaining to the self
accreditation process or the administration of the Cheque Printer Self Accreditation Program.

1.0 Self accreditation procedures

1.1. Subject to section 1.2 below, Payments Canada will provide a printer identification number to
any eligible cheque printer who attests to compliance with Standard 006 within acceptable
tolerances and deviations as per that standard, and attests to meeting the additional
requirements set out in this document.

1.2. The Printer shall pay an enrolment fee to Payments Canada, due within 30 days of receiving
its printer identification number. Refer to Appendix A, “Schedule of fees”.

1.3. Printers will be allocated a four digit printer identification number by Payments Canada. This
number must be printed on the reverse (back) of all cheques in the upper right hand corner, for
identification purposes, in a minimum 10 point font size and a minimum print contrast signal of
0.60 and shall be prefaced by the words, “Printer ID#” (example: “Printer ID# 1234).

1.4. A Printer may optionally use the letter “B” at the end of the printer identification number,
separated by a dash, to identify cheques for which they are only responsible for the base paper
stock (example: “Printer ID# 1234-B”).

1.5. A Printer is also permitted an additional one character alphabetic suffix immediately following
the printer identification number for internal tracking purposes. This optional one character suffix
may not be a “B” to avoid confusion with a “B” used in accordance with section 1.4, above.
(examples: “Printer ID# 1234X”; or “Printer ID# 1234X-B”).
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1.6. Payments Canada will maintain and publish on its website
(https://www.payments.ca/our-directories/self-accredited-cheque-printers) an alphabetical list of
the names and printer identification numbers of all Printers.

1.7. Printers will be required to re-attest to self accreditation annually and pay a renewal fee. Refer
to Appendix A, “Schedule of fees”. Payments Canada will issue an invoice for the renewal fee no
later than 30 days prior to the expiry of the self accreditation. Failure to pay the renewal fee prior
to the date of expiry of the self accreditation will result in the automatic revocation of the printer
identification number.

1.8. Printers are prohibited from printing an invalid, expired or revoked printer identification
number on the back of any cheques.

1.9. Customers of Printers will not be required to submit sample cheques to their financial
institution for testing provided that a valid printer identification number has been printed on the
back of the cheque.

1.10. In order to have their cheques exempt from a financial institution’s cheque testing
requirements, a Printer must submit an attestation (in the form of the sample provided in
Appendix B) that they have performed a self assessment and meet the prerequisites and agree to
the requirements outlined in this document.

1.11. The Printer agrees to put adequate cheque testing processes in place, following industry
best practices, in order to ensure that all cheques imprinted with their printer identification
number are in compliance with Standard 006 within acceptable tolerances and deviations as per
that standard. Industry best practices are outlined in Appendix C.

1.12. All testing equipment used by Printer must be properly maintained and calibrated as per the
manufacturer’s instructions. Industry best practices are outlined in Appendix C.

1.13. Upon request, the Printer agrees to provide a report(s) to their customers verifying that a
sample of cheques from each print order/run has been tested and that the cheques are in
compliance with Standard 006.

1.14. The Printer agrees to maintain records of cheque testing reports and equipment
maintenance and calibration reports for a minimum period of two years.

1.15. Printers are prohibited from representing in any way that Payments Canada has endorsed or
accredited the Printer or any of its products.
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2.0 Revocation of printer identification numbers

2.1. Production problems identified by financial institutions resulting from reader/sorter rejection
rates exceeding 1% (per payor) or from poor image quality and traced back to a specific Printer
(using the printer identification number) will result in a review of the Printer’s compliance with the
self accreditation requirements [following the dispute resolution process in Section 3.0 below].

2.2. Problems identified by financial institutions relating to a Printer’s failure to meet any of the
requirements set out in this document, will result in a review of the Printer’s compliance with the
self accreditation requirements [following the dispute resolution process in Section 3.0 below].

2.3. Within five business days of becoming aware of a potential compliance issue, Payments
Canada will issue a letter advising the Printer that an issue has been raised.

2.4. The Printer must respond to Payments Canada within 10 business days of receiving a letter
confirming receipt of the letter and advising of any corrective action to be taken to resolve the
issue.

2.5. If the Printer is found to be in non-compliance with the self accreditation requirements and
have not produced a sufficient corrective action plan, their self accreditation will be revoked.

2.6. Printers who have had their self accreditation revoked for reasons other than non payment of
renewal fees will be permitted to re-apply for self accreditation following a period of one year from
the date that the self accreditation was revoked and will be required to pay the application fee and
attest to any corrective action taken in relation to the problem which lead to the revocation of their
printer identification number.

2.7. Printers who have had their self accreditation revoked for failure to pay the renewal fee will be
permitted to re-apply for self accreditation at any time and will be required to pay the enrolment
fee.

3.0 Dispute resolution

3.1. Payments Canada will maintain a list of contacts for both Printers and financial institutions
which can be used by either party in the event of a disagreement, dispute, question or issue (a
“Dispute”) that arises.

3.2. In the event of a Dispute, the Printer(s) and financial institution(s) involved shall first appoint
appropriate representatives from each party to discuss the Dispute and try to find a resolution,
prior to proceeding with the formal dispute resolution process outlined in sections 3.3-3.8 below.

3.3. Any Dispute arising out of or relating to the self accreditation program that cannot be
resolved outside of the dispute resolution process will be referred in writing to Payments Canada.
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Notwithstanding the foregoing, isolated incidents of non-compliance should not be referred to
Payments Canada for resolution, as the intention of the dispute resolution process is to address
repeated non-compliance (e.g. printing issues in which items are being consistently produced that
are not Standard 006 compliant).

3.4. Payments Canada will act as a liaison and co-ordinate the establishment of a review panel (a
“Dispute panel”) which will be comprised of: two members appointed by the financial institution(s)
involved in the Dispute, two members appointed by the Printer(s) involved in the Dispute and a
member appointed by Payments Canada.

3.5. The Printer(s) and/or financial institution(s) may retain the services of third party experts in
support of the dispute resolution process.

3.6. Any costs incurred by the Dispute panel or Payments Canada in connection with the
resolution of a Dispute will be reimbursed by one or both of the parties involved in the Dispute, as
determined by the Dispute panel.

3.7. The Dispute panel will determine an efficient method(s) by which it will attempt to resolve the
Dispute (e.g., by telephone, email communications or face to face meetings), which will provide
each party a reasonable opportunity to present its position. Resolution of the Dispute will be by a
majority decision of the members of the Dispute panel.

3.8. If it was determined that corrective action is required on behalf of the Printer; the Dispute
panel will review the corrective action plan and timelines provided and determine if the printer
identification number should be revoked.
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Appendix A

Schedule of fees

All fees are payable to Payments Canada, and are intended to cover the costs of the
administration of the Cheque Printer Self Accreditation Program. The fee structure will be
reviewed annually by Payments Canada, to ensure full recovery of all costs.

Enrollment fee

An enrolment fee of $1000.00 (plus applicable taxes) is payable upon initial enrolment in the
Cheque Printer Self Accreditation Program.

A Printer who has had its self accreditation revoked is required to pay the enrolment fee when
having its self accreditation re-instated.

Renewal fee

A renewal fee of $350.00 (plus applicable taxes) is payable each year by all Printers who remain in
good standing in order to maintain its self accreditation.

Reimbursement Fees

A Printer that withdraws from participation in the program will not be reimbursed for any paid
enrollment or renewal fees.

If the program is terminated by participating financial institutions, Payments Canada will
reimburse each accredited Printer as follows:

(a)If the program is terminated in the first year of a Printer’s enrolment, the enrolment fee
will be reimbursed on a prorated basis for the remainder of that year.

(b) If the program is terminated in the second or subsequent year of a Printer’s enrolment,
the renewal fee paid for that year will be reimbursed on a pro-rated basis for the remainder
of the year. No amount will be reimbursed for the enrolment fee or renewal fee(s) paid in a
previous year.
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Appendix B

Cheque printer self accreditation application
On behalf of, [insert company name], we confirm that a self-assessment has been completed and
attest that [insert company name] meets the prerequisites and requirements outlined in the
Cheque Printer Self Accreditation Program (version 2.1, dated 07-06-2023) and that our
documents are compliant with Standard 006 within acceptable tolerances and deviations as per
the standard. Further, we agree to abide by the terms of the self accreditation program including
the dispute resolution process.

Date:

Signature of signing authority:

Title of signing authority:

Contact Information

Company name:

Contact name:

Address:

Phone number:

E-mail address:

Please e-mail signed documentation to: paymentservices@payments.ca
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Appendix C

Best practices for cheque testing

Under the terms of the self accreditation program, Printers attest to the capability to produce
Standard 006 compliant cheques. The following guidelines are based on industry best
practices and are provided to assist Printers in this regard.

1.0 Cheque testing equipment

1.1 Equipment used by Printers must meet industry best practices. All equipment used in Canada
for qualifying and testing MICR signal strength and image readiness are listed below. The list of
equipment contained in sections 1.2 and 1.3 below, constitutes equipment recommended for
performing tests to comply with Standard 006. To test for compliance with Standard 006, Printers
are required to have equipment produced no earlier than 2000 that will test for: image readiness
and MICR (including at a minimum signal level, character dimension, character spacing, country
format and extraneous ink/toner).

1.2 Image/MICR testing equipment - Industry’s best

(A) QCX Models 8053GE-A/8053GE-B/8053GE-C

The most accurate MICR testing device and is used by financial institutions around the world to
analyze MICR documents. Allows for the testing of both the magnetic and optical characteristics
of MICR in order to address the complete requirements of the reader sorters and other tools to
process MICR documents. Tester also has the ability to test the image readiness of cheques as
set out by Standard 006.

1.2.1 Image testing equipment

(A) Image Qualifier IQX97 - OCR
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The Image Qualifier tests for image readiness.

1.2.2 MICR testing equipment:

(A) MICR Qualifier (GTX)

The GTX reader attaches to a Windows based PC where software offers extensive analysis and
reporting capability. New releases of software offer added functionality without affecting the
accuracy of the test.

Both the Image Qualifier IQX97-OCR and MICR Qualifier GTX are still compliant with Standard
006. However, please note that manufacturers are no longer providing parts, service or software
upgrades for either tester. Both testers reached their end of life in 2017. Both testers have been
replaced by the QCX.

(B) QCV/MICR Verifier

The QCV/MICR Verifier was designed as a less expensive standalone MICR tester. The test is the
same test that the GTX (signal level, character dimensions, format, spacing and extraneous
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ink/toner, but the QCV/Verifier does not meet all required specifications). The discrepancy in
signal level is up to 10%. The QCV/MICR Verifier does not have the ability to test MICR optically.
The newer QCV also allows users to attach to a PC for more detailed results and reporting.

(C) QCV 11/14/MH(x) Verifier

The QCV 11/14 and MH(x) Verifier incorporates all the features of the MICR Verifier and in
addition has the ability to test the MICR line at various positions on an 11 or 14 inch document.

(D) In-Line Verifier

The In-Line Verifier is designed for use when printing continuous cheques allowing brief pauses in
print without disruption to web.

(E) Check Sheet

The Check Sheet is used for testing the MICR of an entire sheet for large-scale operations.

1.3. To test for compliance with Standard 006, Printers may also use: printing and layout gauges;
pocket comparators; SGM Vision System & SGM-1 Tester; and Easy Check.
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1.4. Equipment is acceptable as long as it continues to function in compliance with the most
current standards as determined by the Canadian Standards Association or until equipment is no
longer functioning within the manufacturer’s specifications.

2.0 MICR equipment calibration

2.1. All MICR testing equipment shall be calibrated at least weekly or if used less frequently, upon
use. If equipment maintains calibration within + or – 2 points consistently, calibration is not
required as often, conversely, if equipment goes out of calibration quickly, ensure more frequent
calibration and consider a maintenance overhaul. If equipment does not calibrate properly, it must
be returned to the manufacturer or other approved service technician for repair and recalibration.

2.2. Calibration includes calibration for transport speed and signal strength. When calibrating,
transport speed should be calibrated first, followed by calibration for signal strength.

2.3. For dimension measurements, Standard 006 requires compliance to a stroke width tolerance
of + or – 0.003”. Only the MICR Qualifier GTX is preset with a stroke width tolerance of + or –
0.003”, other equipment is shipped with a preset width tolerance of + or – 0.004” and should be
adjusted for compliance. For detailed instructions on calibration, Printers should contact the
equipment manufacturer.

3.0 Image qualifier calibration

3.1. The image qualifier shall be calibrated at least monthly as directed by the software program
or more frequently as the user determines. The system logs calibration and logs can be printed
for permanent record retention.

4.0 Calibration documents

4.1. MICR testing equipment: Calibration documents are supplied with testers and have
recommended expiry dates indicated on the document. However, depending on tester use,
documents should be replaced every 12 to 18 months or when the calibration record provided
with the calibration document is full. Signal strength documents are magnetic and should be
stored away from electric or magnetic fields. If the documents become soiled or damaged,
documents should be replaced more often.

4.2. Image qualifier equipment: Calibration documents are provided with each new image
qualifier. Documents should be kept in a clean, dark environment to prevent damage from
exposure to light. Calibration documents should be replaced if the document is damaged.
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5.0 Maintenance

5.1. MICR testing equipment is particularly sensitive to wet ink and toner build-up on the rollers
and reading heads affecting the read speed and accuracy of measurement. The manufacturer
recommends that MICR testing equipment be serviced every 12 to 18 months. Rollers and belts
should be changed, ink and toner removed from read heads and equipment recalibrated by an
approved service technician (for equipment warranty service see manufacturer's warranty
agreement or check with your service provider).

5.2. For the maintenance of image qualifier equipment, clean glass surface of scanner with soft
lint free cloth to ensure clear readings.

6.0 Training

6.1. Supervisors, press operators, quality control staff and management, as determined by the
Printer, are trained on the proper use of the image qualifier and MICR testing equipment. Only
trained staff shall perform quality testing.

6.2. Training records shall be maintained for all staff who have received training for at least the
length of accreditation.

7.0 Testing

7.1. MICR and image testing must be performed at print setup and prior to run approvals. Only
staff that have been trained and accredited by the Printer to carry out MICR readability and image
qualification tests shall perform testing.

7.2. Best practices suggest that in a digital/toner/inkjet environment testing is required every
3000–5000 cheques. Ribbons shall be checked every time they are replaced. Offset is generally
tested about every 20 minutes of run time or when the printing is halted.

7.3. Tests will include at a minimum:

MICR testing

i. Signal level averages

ii. Character dimension (magnetic and visual inspection)

iii. Character spacing

iv. Country format (MICR spec sheets shall be used)
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v. Extraneous ink / toner

vi. Visual check other checks to ensure Standard 006 compliance

Image qualifier - Tests are performed for both front and back of cheque

i. Legibility

ii. Dynamic contrast

iii. Reflectance

7.4. Where documents are found to be non-compliant, production will stop, produced and
non-conforming materials destroyed and testing repeated until compliance is achieved.
Non-conforming product must not be shipped.
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